
WAPDA Decade of Dams

The bids from eligible firms or persons (Distributors/Suppliers) who are 
registered with income tax and sales tax department and on ATL of FBR for 
supply of Miscellaneous Items Including Surigcal disposable items / Dental 
items / medicines. The bidding shall be conducted in line with the Single 
Stage – One Envelope Bidding Procedure   of the procurement Rules 
2004 and any Regulations, Regulatory Guides, Procurement Guidelines or 
Instructions issued by the PPRA (from time to time), and is open to all 
Potential bidders.

Bidding documents, containing detailed terms and conditions, etc. are 
available and can be downloaded from E-PADS PPRA Web site 
www.eprocure.gov.pk free of cost. Bidders need to get registered at E-Web 
portal of E-PADS PPRA (Federal) to access the tender document and other 
relevant information including electronic bid submission.

Bids should be submitted electronically ONLY through EPADS PPRA web 
portal. Manual submission of bid, without EPADS electronic bid is Not 
acceptable. For registration and training on EPADS or in case of any difficulty 
in using EPADS,prospective bidder/s may also contract PPRA helpine 
051-111-137-237.

The bids prepared in accordance  with the instructions in the bidding 
document must be submitted through EPADS web portal by closing date & 
Time mentioned in the tender document. The closing date for bids will be 
15th May, 2025 and tender will be closed on 11:00 AM and opening time on 
the same day at 11:30 AM through EPADS All interested bidders must 
register themselves at EPADS by using link: 
https://eprocure.gov.pk/#/supplier/registeration

Original Bid Security and Tender Free instrument MUST BE attached with 
the Proposal and the reference / pay Order copy must be submitted through 
EPADS online submission as well, before Tender Closing Date & Time (For 
Local Bidders Only).

Bidder Must claim their deposit refund (Bid Security/performance 
Gurantee) within 180 days of the financial bid opening (if rates are higher 
side) or completion of contract period/project (in case awarded) or in case of 
any earlier termination. The time barred CRs (receipts)/refund cases shall 
not be processed. All bids must be accompanied by a Bid Security in the 
shape of CDR/PAY order/DD @5% (five percent)

Bidding  documents showing detailed terms and conditions, method of 
procurement, procedure for submission of bids, bid security, bid validity, 
opening of bid, evaluation criteria, clarification / rejection of bids, 
performance guarantee etc. If bid closing / opening date falls on local / 
national holiday, the date of bid closing / opening shall be the next working 
day on the same time and venue.
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